

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE: K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES **SPONSORING DISTRICT:**
BID NUMBER: P2021-04C **DISTRICT CONTACT:**
CONTRACT PERIOD: Jan. 1, 2022 - Dec. 31, 2022
LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY **MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT:** \$50.00 **DELIVERY:** 30 Calendar Days ARO

VENDOR NAME	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX NUMBER WEBSITE	CONTACT NAME
Pyramid School Products - include "#P2021-04C" on all orders	6510 N 54th Street Tampa, FL 33610		
School Specialty - include bid #123074 on all orders	W6316 Design Drive Greenville, WI 54942		
Southwest School and Office Supply	3790 De Forest Circle Jurupa Valley, CA 91752		

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - BID RECOMMENDATION

BID TITLE: K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES
 BID NUMBER: P2021-04C

SPONSORING DISTRICT: SAN MARCOS UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
 DISTRICT CONTACT: VICKI CAPOZZA vicki.capozza@smusd.org

MINIMUM FREE SHIPPING \$50.00
 LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

CONTRACT PERIOD: 01/01/22 - 12/31/22

PH: (760) 290-2374

DELIVERY: 30 CALENDAR DAYS A.R.O.

ITEM NO.	EST USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfr Model #	Vendor Stock #	Price
1 - 30011	155	Doz	Brushes, art enamel, 1", Imperial #3160-1	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3160-1	3160BX	\$6.40
2	21	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 1/4", Crayola #1261-004, Imperial #3261-SP4, School Smart	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3161-SP4	3261SP04BX	\$2.16
3	448	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 1/2", Imperial #3261-SP12, School Smart	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #31261-SP12	3261SP12BX	\$2.64
4	82	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 3/4", Imperial #3261-SP18, School Smart	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3261-SP18	3261SP18BX	\$3.60
5-30013	347	Doz	Brushes, easel, size 1, Imperial #3261-SP20, School Smart 1570360	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3261-SP20	3261SP20BX	\$3.84
6	421	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 3, Imperial #3127-3, School Smart	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3127-3	312703BX	\$1.35
7	27	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 7, Imperial #3127-7	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #31270-7	312707BX	\$3.30
8 - 30019	25	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 8, Imperial #3127-8, School Smart	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3127-8	312708BX	\$1.76
9	66	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 9, Imperial #3127-9	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3127-9	312709BX	\$3.60
10-30020	71	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 10, Imperial #3127-10, School Smart 1567559	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3127-10	312710BX	\$2.22
11-30021	236	Doz	Brushes, water color, camel hair, size 12, Imperial #3127-12, School Smart 1567560	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #3127-12	312712BX	\$2.70
12- 30173	26	Box	Chalk, colored, 3-3/16" x 7/16", assorted, 12 colors/box, Prang Ambrite #53012, BIN #51-0403 AST, Sargent 22-4132, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #51-0403	3255012	\$1.46
13-30024	827	Each	Clay, modeling, four 1/4lb sticks/box, permanently pliable, 4 colors red, green, blue, yellow, individually wrapped sticks, Dixon #740, Crayola #206, School Smart, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Dixon #00740	3350AD	\$1.31
14	50	Box	Clay, low fire, Cone 6, moist, red, 50 lb/box, Laguna #EM207, Imperial #3360RD, Amaco Sedona #67 AP Non-Toxic Label Required, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Laguna EM-207	336ORD	\$23.00

15	60	Box	Clay, low fire, Cone 6, moist, white, 50 lb/box, Laguna #EM210, Imperial #3360WE, AP Non-Toxic Label Required, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Laguna EM-210	3360WE	\$24.80
16	160	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16" Multicultural flesh tone, standard size, 8 colors/box, BIN #52-008W, Dixon #38018, Art & Craft MSDS DISCONTINUED CURRENTLY NO APPROVED ALTERNATE.				
17-30147	8,077	Box	Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Primary, 8 assorted colors/box, Crayola BIN #52-0080, Dixon #00900, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #52-0080	34091	\$0.54
18-30026	10,089	Box	Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Primary, 16 assorted colors/box, Dixon #25116, BIN #52-0336 Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #52-0336	341116	\$1.47
19-30146	3,827	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 8 colors/box, 12 box/carton, BIN #52-0008, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #52-0008	340108	\$0.27
20	51,178	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 16 colors/box, Dixon #00100, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #52-0016	340116	\$0.43
21	2,524	Box	Crayons, Anti-Roll, Triangular, 8 assorted colors, Crayola #BIN52-4008 or approved equal	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #52-4008	3414508	\$0.83
22	223	Each	Glitter, 1 lb, Glitterex #3440, Classroom Select, Pacon-Spectra, School Smart, AP Certified Art & Craft MSDS	School Specialty	School Smart		Bid a Single Price for all colors below
				Blue	2004129	2004129	\$4.56
				Gold	2004126	2004126	
				Green	2004133	2004133	
				Multi	2004131	2004131	
				Red	2004121	2004121	
Silver	2004125	2004125					
23-40007	21,979	Each	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, plastic bottle, 4 oz, 12/carton, Borden #E304, Elmer's/Ross #114, Sargent 22-1201, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Elmers #E304	103604	\$0.54
24-40020	783	Each	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, plastic bottle, POINTED TIP, 8 oz, 12/carton, Borden #E308, Elmer's/Ross #0008-BD, Sargent 22-1203, School Smart 1565695, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Elmers #E308	103608	\$0.95
25-40027	278	Each	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, 1 gallon size, 2/carton, Borden #E340, Rich Art #SG128, School Smart 1565727, Art & Craft MSDS	School Specialty	School Smart #1565727	1565727	\$7.88
26	2,680	Set	Markers, Bold Colors, Ultra-Clean Washable, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines, 8 colors/set includes plum, golden yellow, primrose, azure, copper, emerald, teal and raspberry. B&S #58-78328018. Art & Craft MSDS. DISCONTINUED CURRENTLY NO APPROVED ALTERNATE.				
27	14,030	Set	Markers, Classic Colors, Ultra-Clean Washable, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 8 colors/set B&S #58-78088019, Dixon Prang #80680. Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #58-7808	375008C	\$1.50
28	600	Set	Markers, Classic Colors, NON-WASHABLE, Water Soluble, Water-Based Ink. MADE IN AMERICA. Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 8 colors/set. Crayola #58-7708, Dixon Prang #80128. AP Certified Non-Toxic. Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #58-7708	374508C	\$1.34
29-30065	163	Set	Markers, Washable Broad line conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 12 colors/set, Must wash from skin, clothing and painted walls; B&S 58-7812; Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #58-7812	375012C	\$2.36

30	1,079	Set	Markers, Multicultural Colors, Ultra-Clean Washable, Broad-Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; Must wash from skin, clothing and painted walls; 8 colors/set includes golden-beige, tawny, beige, bronze, mahogany, tan, sienna and terracotta. B&S #58-78018013, Art & Craft MSDS. DISCONTINUED CURRENTLY NO APPROVED ALTERNATE.					
31		Doz	Markers, Scented, Chisel Tip for bold and fine lines; thick barrel. Assorted Colors; 12 colors & flavors/set to include flavors: Magenta-Raspberry, Pink-Watermelon, Red-Cherry, Orange-Orange, Yellow-Banana, Green-Mint, Dark Green-Apple, Turquoise-Fruit Punch, Blue-Blueberry, Purple-Grape, Brown-Cinnamon & Black-Licorice. Ink won't bleed through paper. Mr. Sketch, Sanford 20072, NO SUBSTITUTE. AP Certified. Non-Toxic Art & Craft MSDS	Pyramid School Products	Sanford Mr. Sketch #20072 1905069	same	\$4.09	
32		Doz	Markers, Scented, Chisel Tip for bold and fine lines; thick barrel. Assorted Colors; 12 colors & flavors/set. Mr. Sketch, Sanford 20072, Silly Scents Crayola #58-8199, or equal. AP Certified. Non-Toxic Art & Craft MSDS	Pyramid School Products	Crayola #58-8199	same	\$4.39	
33-30044	334	Set	Markers, Tropical Colors, Ultra-Clean Washable, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; Must wash from skin, clothing and painted walls; 8 colors/set includes tropical violet, parrot pink, sandy tan, blue lagoon, dolphin gray, wild orchid, sea foam green and coral reef. B&S #58-78168011. Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #58-7816	375008t	\$1.57	
34	2,680	Doz	Markers, Bulk, Broad Line Conical tip, All Colors, Crayola Original ; 12 markers/box. #58-770080xx, AP Certified; Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola		\$2.59	
					Black	Crayola #58-7700-051		3745BK
					Blue	Crayola #58-7700-042		3745BE
					Brown	Crayola #58-7700-007		3745BN
					Green	Crayola #58-7700-044		3745GN
					Orange	Crayola #58-7700-036		3745OE
					Red	Crayola #58-7700-038		3745RD
					Violet	Crayola #58-7700-040		3745VT
	Yellow	Crayola #58-7700-034	3745YW					
35	69	Jar	Paint, finger, liquid, 16 oz, Crayola, Prang, School Smart, Color-Brite #SC 3515-XX, Sargent Art-Time, Art & Craft MSDS	School Specialty	School Smart		\$1.41	
					Black	2002420		2002420
					Blue	2002424		2002424
					Brown	2002421		2002421
					Green	2002416		2002416
					Orange	2002415		2002415
					Red	2002423		2002423
					Violet	2002417		2002417
					White	2002419		2002419
					Yellow	2002418		2002418
		Southwest School & Office Supply						
		30158	Black	Sunburst 3500BK	3500BK			
		30159	Blue	Sunburst 3500BE	3500BE			
		30162	Brown	Sunburst 3500BN	3500BN			

36	5,077	Jar	30163	Green		Sunburst 3500GN	3500GN	\$1.40
				Magenta		Sunburst 3500MA	3500MA	
			30164	Orange		Sunburst 3500OE	3500OE	
				Peach		Sunburst 3500PH	3500PH	
			30165	Red		Sunburst 3500RD	3500RD	
			30166	Turquoise		Sunburst 3500TE	3500TE	
			30161	Violet		Sunburst 3500VT	3500VT	
			30167	White		Sunburst 3500WE	3500WE	
			30168	Yellow		Sunburst 3500YW	3500YW	
37-30073	13,542	Set	Paint, Water Color, 8 oval pans, assorted, with brush, 12 sets/carton, Prang #00800, B&S #53-0080, Crayola Artista II 53-1508, or equal, Art & Craft MSDS		Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #53-0080	35808	\$1.41
38	7,068	Set	Paint, Water Color, 8 oval pans, assorted, with brush, 12 sets/carton, Crayola Artista II 53-1508, NO SUBSTITUTE , Art & Craft MSDS		Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #53-1508	358901	\$1.46
39	178	Rolls	Paper, Art Craft, 36" wide x 1000', 50lb, Duo-Finish. Pacon-Spectra ArtKraft, Color-Brite #5560		Southwest School & Office Supply			
				Autumn Gold		Colorbrite #5560GD	5560GD	\$55.52
				Black		Colorbrite #5560BK	5560BK	\$49.33
				Bright Green		Colorbrite #5560GN	5560GN	\$59.50
				Brown		Colorbrite #5560BN	5560BN	\$47.91
				Canary		Colorbrite #5560CY	5560CY	\$57.37
				Dark Blue		Colorbrite #5560BE	5560BE	\$47.61
				Emerald Green		Colorbrite #5560GN	5560GN	\$43.57
				Flame		Colorbrite #5560FRD	5560FRD	\$58.03
				Gray		Colorbrite #5560GY	5560GY	\$58.64
				Light Blue		Colorbrite #5560AQ	5560AQ	\$57.78
				Light Green		Colorbrite #5560LGN	5560LGN	\$57.44
				Orange		Colorbrite #5560OE	5560OE	\$54.94
				Pink		Colorbrite #5560PK	5560PK	\$55.34
				Purple		Colorbrite #5560PE	5560PE	\$56.53
				Scarlet		Colorbrite #5560ST	5560ST	\$51.94
	Sky Blue		Colorbrite #5560BE	5560BE	\$56.53			
	White		Colorbrite #5560WE	5560WE	\$45.00			
40	115	Rolls	Paper, Art Craft, 36" wide x 1000', 40lb, FIRE/FLAME RETARDANT , All colors. Pacon-Decolor, Southwest Private Label #SSS5550xx		Southwest School & Office Supply			
				Black		Southwest 5500BK	5500BK	\$76.55
				Blue		Southwest 5500BE	5500BE	\$82.17
				Dark Brown		Southwest 5500BN	5500BN	\$81.70
				Emerald		Southwest 5500GN	5500GN	\$87.52
				Orange		Southwest 5500OE	5500OE	\$84.94
				Pink		Southwest 5500PK	5500PK	\$80.03
				Purple		Southwest 5500PE	5500PE	\$81.19
				Red		Southwest 5500FRD	5500FRD	\$84.57
				Sky Blue		Southwest 5500SBE	5500SBE	\$80.75
				White		Southwest 5500WE	5500WE	\$65.86
	Yellow		Southwest 5500YW	5500YW	\$81.56			

41	22	Rolls	Paper, Butcher, white, 36" wide roll, 50 lb, Crown Imperial #5575-36, APC #5036 WK, School Smart 086654	School Specialty	School Smart 086654	086654	\$40.40
42	6,906	Pkg	Paper, Construction, 9"x12", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76# basis, 50% recycled fiber content & recyclable. All colors incl. asstd. (brightness & range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray, Imperial Color-Brite	Southwest School & Office Supply	Colorbrite		\$1.38
			Assorted		Colorbrite #5690 AD	5960AD	
			Black		Colorbrite #5690 BK	5690BK	
			Blue		Colorbrite #5690 BE	5690HLE	
			Brilliant Lime		Colorbrite #5690 HLE	5690HLE	
			Chartreuse		Colorbrite #5690 CE	5690CE	
			Dark Brown		Colorbrite #5690 DBN	5690DBN	
			Dark Green		Colorbrite #5690 DGN	5690DGN	
			Festive Green		Colorbrite #5690 FGN	5690FGN	
			Festive Red		Colorbrite #5690 FRD	5690FRD	
			Gold		Colorbrite #5690 GD	5690GD	
			Gray		Colorbrite #5690 PGY	5690PGY	
			Holiday Green		Colorbrite #5690 HGN	5960HGN	
			Holiday Red		Colorbrite #5690 HRD	5960HRD	
			Light Green		Colorbrite #5690 LGN	5690GN	
			Light Red			No Bid	
			Lilac		Colorbrite #5690 LC	5690LC	
			Magenta		Colorbrite #5690 MA	5690MA	
			Multi Cultural		Pacon 9509	5005ML	
			Orange		Colorbrite #5690 OE	5690OE	
			Pink		Colorbrite #5690 PK	5690PK	
			Pumpkin		Colorbrite #5690 PN	5690PN	
			Purple		Colorbrite #5690 PE	5690PE	
			Red		Colorbrite #5690 RD	5690RD	
			Royal Blue		Colorbrite #5690 RBE	5690RBE	
			Salmon		Colorbrite #5690 SN	5690SN	
			Shocking Pink		Colorbrite #5690 HPK	5690HPK	
Sky Blue		Colorbrite #5690 SBE	5690SBE				
Tan		Colorbrite #5690 TN	5690 TN				
Turquoise		Colorbrite #5690 TE	5690TE				
Violet		Colorbrite #5690 VT	5690VT				
Warm Brown		Colorbrite #5690 WBN	5690WBN				
White		Colorbrite #5690 WE	5690WE				
Yellow		Colorbrite #5690 YW	5690YW				
			Paper, Construction, 12"x18", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76# basis, 50% recycled fiber content and recyclable. All colors including assorted (brightness and range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray, Imperial Color-Brite	Southwest School & Office Supply			
			30088 Assorted		Colorbrite #5700AD	5700AD	
			30089 Black		Colorbrite #5700BK	5700BK	
			30081 Blue		Colorbrite #5700BE	5700BE	
			Chartreuse		Colorbrite #5700CE	5700CE	
			Dark Blue		Colorbrite #5700DBE	5700DBE	
			30098 Dark Brown		Colorbrite #5700DBN	5700DBN	

43	37,423	Pkg	30093	Dark Green		Colorbrite #5700DGN	5700DGN	\$2.72
			30100	Festive Green		Colorbrite #5700FGN	5700GN	
				Festive Red		Colorbrite #5700FRD	5700FRD	
				Gold		Colorbrite #5700GD	5700GD	
				Holiday Green		Colorbrite #5700HGN	5700HGN	
			30092	Holiday Red		Colorbrite #5700HRD	5700HRD	
			30085	Hot Lime		Colorbrite #5700HLE	5700HLE	
			30087	Hot Pink		Colorbrite #5700HPK	5700HPK	
				Light Brown		Colorbrite #5700LBN	5700LBN	
			30095	Light Green		Colorbrite #5700LGN	5700LGN	
				Light Red			No Bid	
				Light Yellow		Colorbrite #5700LYW	5700LYW	
				Lilac		Colorbrite #5700LC	5700LC	
			30084	Magenta		Colorbrite #5700MA	5700MA	
			30096	Orange		Colorbrite #5700OE	5700OE	
				Peach		Colorbrite #5700PH	5700PH	
				Pearl Gray		Colorbrite #5700PGY	5700PGY	
			30097	Pink		Colorbrite #5700PK	5700PK	
			30086	Pumpkin		Colorbrite #5700PN	5700PN	
				Purple		Colorbrite #5700PE	5700PE	
				Red		Colorbrite #5700RD	5700RD	
			30090	Royal Blue		Colorbrite #5700RBE	5700RBE	
				Salmon		Colorbrite #5700SN	5700SN	
30099	Sky Blue		Colorbrite #5700SBE	5700SBE				
30082	Slate Gray		Colorbrite #5700SGY	5700SGY				
	Sunshine Yellow		Colorbrite #5700SYW	5700SYW				
30094	Tan		Colorbrite #5700TN	5700TN				
30083	Turquoise		Colorbrite #5700TE	5700TE				
30102	Violet		Colorbrite #5700VT	5700VT				
	Warm Brown		Colorbrite #5700WBN	5700WBN				
	White		Colorbrite #5700WE	5700WE				
	30101	Yellow		Colorbrite #5700YW	5700YW			
44	111	Pkg	Paper, Construction, 24"x36", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76# basis, 50% recycled fiber content and recycable. All colors including assorted (brightness and range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray, Imperial Color-Brite	Southwest School & Office Supply				
				Assorted (10 colors)		Colorbrite #5720AD	5720AD	
				Black		Colorbrite #5720BK	5720BK	\$12.50
				White		Colorbrite #5720WE	5720WE	
45	86	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, manila, 9"x12", 60 lb, Everett, Sax, Imperial #5295-09, American Paper #609, Pacon	School Specialty	Sax #085570	085570	\$5.10	
46-30103	97	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, manila, 12"x18", 500 sheets/pkg, 55 lb basis, Everett #EVP46726, Imperial #5290-12 60#, American #5612M, SAX 085574 (removed "4 pkg/bundle")	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #529012	529012	\$10.30	

47	117	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, white, 9"x12", 60 lb, Everett #EVP46151, Riverside #C3173, Imperial #5300-09, American #609W; SAX 053931	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #530009	530009	\$6.57
48-30104	156	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, white, 12"x18", 60 lb basis, 500 sheets/pkg, 4 pkg/bundle, Everett #C3174, Imperial #5300-12, American #612W, SAX 053934	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #530012	530012	\$12.23
49-30106	70	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, white, 12"x18", 80 lb basis, Riverside/Everett "Tru-Rite" #C3182/46-172, Imperial 5305-12, SAX 053946	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #530512	530512	\$16.10
50-30105	137	Pkg	Paper, Drawing, white, 18"x24", 60 lb basis, Riverside/Everett "Tru-Rite" #C3175, Imperial #5300-18, American #618W, SAX 053937	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #530018	530018	\$27.30
51	24	Pkg	Paper, Finger Paint, 16"x22", Everett #40-102, Pioneer, Imperial #5390, Pacon, American #1622, School Smart 085376	Southwest School & Office Supply	Imperial #53900	53900	\$2.99
52	1,684	Qr	Paper, Tissue, 20"x30" sheets, quire folded, colored, 24 sheets/quire, all colors, Bemis Jason, Crystal Standard, Satin Wrap #5920, Pacon Kolorfast	Southwest School & Office Supply			
			30123 Apple Green		PACON 58110	5920AG	
			Black		PACON 58140	5920BK	
			Brown		PACON 58230	5920BN	
			Cerise		PACON 58300	5920CE	
			30120 Dark Brown		PACON 58430	5920DBN	
			Dark Pink		PACON 58280	5920DPK	
			Desert Tan			No Bid	
			Gold		PACON 58010	5920GD	
			Gray			No Bid	
			30121 Holly Green		PACON 58120	5920HGN	\$2.10
			Lavender		PACON 585290	5920LR	
			30122 Light Blue		PACON 58320	5920LBE	
			30126 Light Pink		PACON 58040	5920LPK	
			Navy		PACON 58462	5920NY	
			30124 Orange		PACON 58160	5920OE	
			30119 Parade Blue		PACON 58332	5920PBE	
			30127 Purple		PACON 58070	5920PE	
			30128 Scarlet		PACON 58030	5920ST	
			Turquoise		PACON 58200	5920TE	
			White		PACON 59000	5920WE	
			30129 Yellow		PACON 58370	5920YW	
53	256	Pkg	Paper, Tissue, 12"x18", 50 sheets/pkg, assorted colors, Bemis Jason, Pacon, Crystal Standard	Southwest School & Office Supply			
			30118 Assorted		Pacon 58520	5910AD	
			Apple Green		Pacon 59127	5910AGN	
			Baby Pink		Pacon 59047	5910bPK	
			Black		Pacon 59147	5910BK	
			Canary		Pacon 59027	5910CY	
			Emerald Green		Pacon 59137	5910EGN	
			National Red		Pacon 59187	5910NRD	
			Orange		Pacon 59167	5910OE	\$2.85

			Purple		Pacon 59077	5910PE	
			Scarlet		Pacon 59037	5910ST	
			Sky Blue		Pacon 593997	5910BE	
			Spring Green		Pacon 59117	5910SGN	
			White		Pacon 59007	5910WE	
54-30074	124	Box	Pastels, Oil, 25 colors/box, Pentel #PHN25, School Smart 1594965, Art & Craft MSDS	School Specialty	School Smart #1594965	1594965	\$1.61
55	560	Box	Pastels, Oil, 12 colors/box, Pentel #PHN12, Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	PentalPHN-12	339012	\$0.83
56	113	Set	Pencils, colored 8 assorted colors/set, pre-sharpened, 3.3mm core. Crayola #68-4008, (School Specialty #008211)	School Specialty	Crayola #68-4008	008211	\$0.88
57	43348	Set	Pencils, Colored, 12 assorted colors/set, B&S #BIN4012, Dixon #22120, RoseArt #1013 1608-12, Sargent 22-7212, Colorbrite SSS3611-12, School Smart 245787	School Specialty	School Smart #245787	245787	\$0.77
58	1240	Set	Pencils, Colored, 24 assorted colors/set, B&S BIN#4024, Dixon #22240, RoseArt #1013 1608-24, Sargent 22-7224, School Smart 245788	School Specialty	School Smart #245788	245788	\$1.92
59-30040	23	Set	Pencils, Colored, 36 assorted colors/set, B&S #BIN68-4036, Dixon #22360	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #68-4036	360036	\$3.08
60	300	Each	Pencils, Watercolor, 12 Color Set, Crayola 68-4302, NO SUBSTITUTE , AP Certified. Non-Toxic Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #68-4302	360412	\$1.80
61	150	Each	Pencils, Watercolor, 12 Color Set, Crayola 68-4302, or equal, AP Certified. Non-Toxic Art & Craft MSDS	Southwest School & Office Supply	Crayola #68-4302	360412	\$1.80
62	158	Pkg	Pipe Cleaners, 12", 1/4" diameter, 100 ea/pkg, assorted colors only, Imperial #3620AD, Spartan #J100A, Chenille Kraft, Pacon #7110	School Specialty	Dixon Creativity Street #PAC7110-01DI	085873	\$1.04
63	511	Pkg	Railroad Board, 22"x28", 6 ply, 25 sheets/pkg, assorted colors, Beveridge, Pacon, Imperial #SC3025-XX	Southwest School & Office Supply			\$8.25
			Black		Imperial #3025BK	3025BK	
			Blue		Imperial #3025RBE	3025RBE	
			Blue, Dark		Imperial #3025DBE	3025DBE	
			Blue, Light		Imperial #3025LBE	3025LBE	
			Brown		Imperial #3025BN	3025BN	
			Canary		Imperial #3025CY	3025CY	
			Cardinal			No Bid	
			Green, Emerald		Imperial #3025LGN	3025LGN	
			Green, Holiday		Imperial #3025HGN	3025HGN	
			Magenta			No Bid	
			Orange		Imperial #3025OE	3025OE	
			Pink		Imperial #3025PK	3025PK	
			Red		Imperial #3025RD	3025RD	
White		Imperial #3025WE	3025WE				
Yellow, Lemon		Imperial #3025LYW	3025LYW				
			Yarn, Acrylic roving, 8 oz, 3 ply, 450' skein all colors, Pacon, Imperial	Southwest School & Office Supply			
			30131 Black		Imperial #3900BK	3900BK	

64	1,045	Each	30133	Brown	Imperial #3900BN	3900BN	\$5.90
				Dark Blue	Imperial #3900DBE	3900DBE	
				Dark Green	Imperial #3900DGN	3900DGN	
				Gold		No Bid	
				Hot Pink	Imperial #3900HPK	3900HPK	
				Lavender	Imperial #3900LR	3900LR	
			30132	Light Blue	Imperial #3900LBE	3900LBE	
			30134	Light Green	Imperial #3900LGN	3900LGN	
				Orange	Imperial #3900OE	3900OE	
				Purple	Imperial #3900PE	3900PE	
			30137	Red	Imperial #3900RD	3900RD	
			30138	White	Imperial #3900WE	3900WE	
			30139	Yellow	Imperial #3900YW	3900YW	